

14-013 Plant Protection Tabulation Sheet

		John Deere			BWI			Helena Chemical		Winfield			Agrium Advance Technologies			
Quantity	Description	Requested Packing	Unit Price	Extended	Vendor Notes	Unit Price	Extended	Vendor Notes	Unit Price	Extended	Unit Price	Extended	Vendor Notes	Unit Price	Extended	Vendor Notes
INSECTICIDES																
128 oz	Merit 75 (or equivalent) WG, WP	4 x 1.6 oz packets	\$83.36/1.6zo.x4x4	\$416.768/128oz	Bandit 75 WSP 1.6oz.x4z4/case	\$ 20.00	\$ 400.00	4x1 lb	\$ 66.40	\$ 332.00	\$ 25.40	\$ 101.60		\$ 20.80	\$ 416.00	Malice 75 WSP
100 LBS	Acephate 75 wg	1 LB cans	\$7.63/.773lb./can	\$763.40/100 cans	Orthene TT&O 97, /773lb./can	\$ 85.33	\$ 711.00	12x1lb	\$ 125.52	\$ 1,046.00	\$ 9.15	\$ 109.80		\$ 8.85	\$ 885.00	
150 LBS	Advion fire ant bait	2 lb canisters	\$32.30/2lbs	\$2422.50/150lbs.		\$ 248.00	\$ 2,325.00	8x2lb	\$ 232.00	\$ 2,175.00	\$ 62.00	\$ 496.00		\$ 31.80	\$ 2,385.00	
20 gals	PRIMO (or equivalent)	2.5g bottle	\$351.80/2.5gal.	\$2814.40/20gal.	Lesco Regimax PGR, 2.5gal./jug	\$ 364.70	\$ 3,647.00	2x1gal	\$ 580.00	\$ 2,900.00	\$ 362.50	\$ 725.00		\$ 150.00	\$ 3,000.00	LPI GameUp
HERBICIDES																
150 gal.	Round Up/Pro	2.5 gal.	\$45.57/2.5 gal.	\$2,734.20	Prosecutor Pro, 2.5gal./jug	\$ 88.24	\$ 2,647.50	2s2.5gal	\$ 80.00	\$ 2,400.00		\$ 71.00	prosedge	\$ 44.25	\$ 2,655.00	Ranger Pro
80 bottles	Sedge-Hammer	1.3 oz	\$62.46/1.3 3oz.btl.	\$4,996.80		\$ 56.19	\$4,735.20	1.3 oz	\$ 78.00	\$ 6,240.00	\$ 71.00	\$ 107.00		\$ 78.50	\$ 6,280.00	
150 gals.	3-Way (24D)	2.5 gal.	\$59.58/2.5 gal.	\$3,574.80		\$ 122.24	\$3,667.20	2x2.5gal	\$ 114.75	\$ 3,442.50	\$ 53.50	\$ 97.50		\$ 58.63	\$ 3,517.80	Mecamine-D
500 gal.	Aqua-Master	2.5 gal	\$62.37/2.5 gal.	\$12,474.00	Aquaneat, 2.5gal./jug	\$ 105.88	\$10,588.00									RoundUP Custom 3 gal
200 grams	Monument	5 x 5-gram packets	\$240.25gm . Box	\$1,920.00		\$ 240.00	\$19,200.00									
100 lbs.	Sure-Guard	5 lbs bottle	\$661.29/5lbs.	\$13,225.80		\$ 2,530.49	\$12,657.45									
Additives & Aquatics																
500 gal.	Spi-Max Blue Dye Indicator	2.5 gal.	\$49/2.5gal.	\$9,800.00	Lesco Tracker Blue, 2.5gal./jug	\$ 137.15	\$13,715.00	2x2.5gal	\$ 160.00	\$ 20,000.00	\$ 68.75	\$ 137.50		\$ 67.50	\$ 13,500.00	LPI Turf Traxblue
1000 lbs	GreenClean Pro Algaecide	50 lb. bags	\$69.40/50lb./bag	\$1,388.00	Phucomycin SCP, 50lb./bag	no bid	no bid		no bid	\$ -	\$ 71.50	\$ 71.50		\$ 100.00	\$ 2,000.00	Curtine Plus
500 gal.	Aquatic Surfactant - Red River	1 gal	No Bid			no bid	no bid		\$ 95.00	\$ 9,500.00	\$ 36.87	\$ 73.75		\$ 28.50	\$ 14,250.00	LPI L1700
750 gal.	Surfactant - Surf-AC 820	1 gal	\$14.45/gal.	\$10,834.50	Lesco 90/10 nonionic Surfactant, 1gal./ea.	\$ 32.67	\$6,127.50	4x1 gal	\$ 74.75	\$ 11,212.00	\$ 36.87	\$ 73.75		\$ 15.00	\$ 11,250.00	Scanner