TRAFFIC SIGNAL EQUIPMENT 12-009

Republic ITS Paradigm Traffic System Inc Consolidated Traffic Controlf S Texas Highway = = Iteris
ITEM ‘QTY | DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE '
LOT 1
1i8 CONTROLLER UNITS no bid 'S 1,850.00 | $ 14,800.00 | no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
LOT 2
1i5 \CABINETS no bid ' $ 8,100.00 | $ 40,500.00 | no bid 'S 8,588.00 | $ 42,940.00 | no bid no bid '$ 9,995.00 | $ 49,975.00 | no bid
LOT 2A
/ADDITIONAL SPRD SPECTRUM RADIO 5 5
15 'TRANCEIVERS no bid $ 1,772.00 | $ 8,860.00 | no bid $ 1,498.00 | $ 7,490.00 no bid no bid $ 1,575.00 | $ 7,875.00 | no bid
LOT 2B
15 /ADDITIONAL CONFLICT MONITORS no bid $ 81500;$ 4,075.00 S 828.00 | $ 4,140.00 S 720.00 | $ 3,600.00 | no bid no bid $ 730.00$ 3,650.00 | no bid
LOT 3
""""""""""""" . I3SECTION 12" POLYCARBONATE TRAFFIC L b
'SIGNAL W/BACK PLATE AND PELCO AB- 0125- ;
. 130 384 MOUNTING BRACKETS 5 '$ 35900 $ 10,770.00 | $ 386.00 | $ 11,580.00 | $  495.00 | $ 14,850.00 $  405.00 | $ 12,150.00 | $  445.00 | $ 13,350.00 |
""""""""""""" 5 SECTION 12" POLYCARBONATE TRAFFIC |
'SIGNAL W/BACK PLATE AND PELCO AB-0125- 3
218 5-84 MOUNTING BRACKETS | '$ 533.00:$ 426400!$ 580.00$ 4,640.00;$ 725.00:$ 5800.00 $ 683.00{$ 546400!S 65800 S5 5,264.00
""""""""""""""" . |PEDESTRIAN SIGNALS W/Z-CRATE VISOR |
'AND CLAMSHELL WITH UNIVERSAL : g :
3132 'MOUNTING HARDWARE AND LED’S. '$  259.00 | $ 8,288.00 | s 285.00 { $ 9,120.00 | $  345.00 | $ 11,040.00 $ 306.00$ 9,792.00 ' $ 332.00  $ 10,624.00
| |PEDESTRIAN PUSH BUTTON ASSEMBLY | o - - T D
4140  |PELCO SE-2011/SE-2121 '$  102.00 | $ 4,080.00 | $ 2600 $ 1,04000 § 14600 § 584000 $ 147.00{$ 588000 $  9450:$ 3,780.00 |
’ 4 SECTION 12” POLYCARBONATE TRAFFIC | ’ i 5 f ’
g SIGNAL W/BACK PLATE AND PELCO AB-0125- | 5 g g g 5 g
5016  5-84 MOUNTING BRACKETS. g '$ 48500 $ 7,760.00 ' $ 438.00 $ 7,008.00 $ 552.00 $ 8,832.00 $ 55300{$ 8848.00 $ 552.00$ 8,832.00 |
’ \Piezio-driven solid state switch Pelco Part # 5 5 5 5 ’
SE 2121 or equal black in color to include |
| mountlng adapter for Ped. Button Assembly g | i ; |
6140  Pelco Part # SE-2023 ' '$ 9500 $ 3,800.00$  67.00 S 2,680.00 $ 148.00 | $ 5,920.00 $ 8500!$ 340000 $  6800:$ 2720.00 |
| 'TOTAL FOR LOT #3 no bid S 38,962.00 | $ 36,068.00 | $ 52,282.00 no bid $ 45,534.00 | $ 44,570.00 | no bid
LOT 4
1112 |4-CH. VEH. DETECTORS 'S 298.00 S 3,576.00 | $ 32500:$ 3,900.00 S 295.00|S$ 3,540.00 'S 185.00{$ 2,220.00 |
2110 |4-CH. 24 VDC POWER SUPPLY 'S 154.00 | $ 1,540.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 2,000.00{$ 180.00 | $ 1,800.00 no bid 'S  159.00$ 1,590.00 | no bid |
3i5 \4 CAMERA VIDEO DETECTION SYSTEM) 1 $13,320.00 | $ 66,600.00 | $14,250.00 { $ 71,250.00 | $ 9,900.00 | $ 49,500.00 | $ 11,675.00 { $ 58,375.00 | no bid '$ 9,650.00 | $ 48,250.00 |
| 'TOTAL FOR LOT #4 no bid S 71,716.00 | no bid $ 77,150.00 | $ 54,840.00 | $ 58,375.00 ' $ 3,810.00 | $ 48,250.00 !
LOT 5
'OPTICOM DISCRIMINATOR MODULE MODEL g - 5
1{16 L752 OR EQUAL i '$ 2,077.00 | $ 33,232.00 | $ 175875 $ 28,140.00 |
"""""""""""" . |OPTICOM OPTICAL DETECTOR MODEL P722
2132 |OREQUAL )
"""""""""""" . TOTALFORLOT# no bid
"""""""""""" 13000 [3CONDUCTORCABLE = 1§ 047
""""""""""" 2 '5'6666"'"" 7CONDUCTORCABLE |
- 10000 20 CONDUCTORCABLE |
420000 [OPTCOM CABLE T
""""""""""""" ."""""""""'.21"661'\1b’UEbe'[66i5'b’éfEé’f”dk“’i%’éi\h’é“ﬁ(ji'\i""; |
54000 (CABLE $ 046 % 184000 LI
i 'TOTAL FOR LOT #6 | no bid $ 45,950.00 | no bid no bid no bid $ 8,200.00 no bid no bid
LOT 7
""""""""""" 14 24 MASTARMW/POLE ~ $ 448000 $17,920.00 | $ 4,287.00 ' $ 17,148.00 1 Lo
2i8 134 MAST ARM W/POLE '$ 5,298.00 | $42,384.00 | $ 5,098.00 | $ 40,784.00 |
38 |44 MASTARMW/POLE 'S 5,487.00  $43,896.00 | $ 6,312.00 $ 50,496.00
45 148 MAST ARM W/POLE ''$ 5,796.00 | $28,980.00 | $ 6,761.00 | $ 33,805.00 |
52 \LONG MAST ARM ASSEMBLY (100 MPH) 55’ | $16,353.00 | $32,706.00 | $ 15,398.00 | $ 30,796.00 |
62 \LONG MAST ARM ASSEMBLY (100 MPH) 60’ | $16,480.00 | $32,960.00 | $ 15,812.00 ;| $ 31,624.00 |
72 LONG MAST ARM ASSEMBLY (100 MPH) 65’ | $16,778.00 | $33,556.00 | $ 16,192.00 | $ 32,384.00 |
| 'TOTAL FOR LOT #7 'S 232,402.00 | $ 237,037.00 | no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
LOT 8
120 |PULL BOXES, SIZE 13 X 24 X 18 'S 188.00{$ 3,760.00 |
2i20 \PULL BOXES, SIZE 17 X 30 X 18 'S 243.00!S$ 4,860.00 |
f 'TOTAL FOR LOT #8 no bid 'S 8,620.00 ! no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
LOT 9
§ ESP-3027-TX-D ORNAMENTAL POLE CROWN ;
1112 'ALUM. WITH AP-0105, 7 1/4” POLE CAP 'S 549.00! S 6,588.00 ! $  900.00 | $ 10,800.00 $ 65069!$ 7,80828 ! S 54500 S 6,540.00 |
ESP-3027—TX-D ORNAMENTAL; POLE CROWN, ;
2124 |ALUM WITH AP-0108, 10 1/2” POLE CAP | 'S 549.00 | $ 13,176.00 | $ 900.00 | $ 21,600.00 $ 65419 |$ 15700.56 | $  545.00 | $ 13,080.00 |
"""""""""""" . |PB-5354-D ALUMINUM ORNAMENTAL POLE |
\BASE, 4-PC. FOR 8: - 12” DIA. POLE (D=9 |
312 W) $ 131900 $ 1582800 $_1,580.00 $ 18,960.00 $ 146975 $ 17,637.00 | $ 129500 $ 15540.00
""""""""""""" . PB-5355-D ALUMINUM ORNAMENTAL POLE ' ’
\BASE, 4-pc. FOR 12” - 16” DIA. POLE (D=12 |
444 11/2"). $ 1,373.00 | $ 60,412.00 $ 1,650.00 | $ 72,600.00 $ 1,520.00 | $ 66,880.00 $ 1,345.00 | $ 59,180.00
""""""""""""" PB53820RNAMENTALPOLECROWNALUM
510 'WITH 18.50"DIA. POLE CAP. $ 729.00 S 7,290.00 $ 975.00{S$ 9,750.00 $ 761.00{$ 761000 $ 710.00i$ 7,100.00
"""""""""""""  |PB-5381 ORNAMENTAL POLE BASE, 4-pc. |
S 616 2,1_.1?,’,’,9_!? __________________________________________________________________________________ $ 301900 $ 48304.00 $ 310000 $ 49,600.00 $ 280140  $ 4482240 $ 284500 $ 4552000
PB 5412 ORNAMENTAL POLE BASE ADAPTER
7116 \FOR LARGE BASE FOR THE LMA'S 'S 993.00$ 15,888.00 $ 950.00!$ 15,200.00 $ 91241 {S$ 1459856 'S 942.00 | $ 15,072.00 no bid
| |TOTALFORLOT# | no bid s 167,486.00 | no bid '$  198,510.00 no bid s 175,056.80 | $ 162,03200, |
LOT 10
| 'SOLAR POWEREDSCHOOL ZONE FLASHER ; g
15 EASSEMBLIES no bid S 4,207.00 i $ 21,035.00 no bid S 6,800.00 i $ 34,000.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
LOT 11
1{130  [Red LED Traffic Signal Lamp | S 37.00 | $ 4,810.00 | $ 38.00 i $ 4,940.00 | $ 41.00 | $ 5,330.00 S 42.00 | $ 5,460.00 | $ 41.00{ $ 5,330.00 |
2i80 \Yellow LED Traffic Signal Lamp LS 48.00 | $ 3,840.00 | $ 43.00 | $ 3,440.00 | $ 47.00 | $ 3,760.00 S 47.00 | $ 3,760.00 | $ 55.25}$  4,420.00 |
3{130  |Green LED Traffic Signal Lamp LS 46.00 | $ 5,980.00 | $ 49.00 | $ 6,370.00 | $ 47.00 | $ 6,110.00 S 60.00 { $ 7,800.00 | $ 55.251$ 7,182.50 |
4160 \Le Green Arrow LED Traffic Signal Lamp LS 53.00 | $ 3,180.00 | $ 44.00 | $ 2,640.00 | $ 48.00 | $ 2,880.00 S 50.00 { $ 3,000.00 | $ 46.50 | S 2,790.00 |
560 Le Yellow Arrow LED Traffic Signal Lamp 'S 41.00 | $ 2,460.00 | $ 47.00 | $ 2,820.00 | $ 37.00 i $ 2,220.00 S 47.00 | $ 2,820.00 | $ 61.60 S 3,696.00 |
650 \Yellow 12 VDC LED Traffic Signal Lamp LS 79.00 { $ 3,950.00 | $ 55.00 | $ 2,750.00 | $ 56.00 | $ 2,800.00 $ 62.00 | $ 3,100.00 { $ 102.00 | $ 5,100.00 |
7i20 | Countdown Pedestrian Signal hd LED 'S 148.00 S 2,960.00 S 167.00S$ 3,340.00 S 13500 $ 2,700.00 $ 155.80!$ 3,116.00 ' $ 172.00 | $ 3,440.00 |
8120 | Red Le Arrow Traffic Signal lamp LED LS 48.00 | $ 960.00 | $ 41.00 | $ 820.00 | $ 44.00 | $ 880.00 S 44.00 | $ 880.00 | $ 38.00 | $ 760.00 |
! ‘Total for lot #11 no bid 'S 28,140.00 | $ 27,120.00 | $ 26,680.00 no bid $ 29,936.00 | $ 32,718.50 | no bid




