#15-004 Irrigation Supplies Irrigators Supply Horizon | JohnDeere | LongHorn | Fortiline Professional Turf
Inc Products
CATEGORY #1 (TORO) $25.49 $30.06 $25.23 $22.95 NO BID $1,234.42
CATEGORY #2 (RAINBIRD) $1,295.54 $4,233.65 | $2,038.70 | $1,351.59 NO BID NO BID
CATEGORY #3 (HUNTER) $510.91 $392.48 $888.94 $768.63 NO BID NO BID
CATEGORJ;#WA'_I(?)/EATHER_ $1,615.48 $1,842.80 $946.07 $1,769.58 NO BID NO BID
CATEGORY #5 (PVC
FITTINGS) $50.11 $184.99 $138.39 $90.51 NO BID NO BID
CATEGORY #6 (PVC PIPE) $2.26 $25.17 $27.53 $27.82 NO BID NO BID
CATEGORY #7 (MISC.
IRRIGATION ITEMS) $8,635.92 $8,305.94 | $7,417.50 | $7,892.58 $634.00 NO BID
CATEGORY #9 STAINLESS
REPAIR CLAMPS NO BID $523.64 NO BID NO BID $1,442.00 NO BID
CATEGORY #10 (RIGGS
SHRUB) NOBID
CATEG?E\;.?;? (MISC. $1,231.01 $1,638.07 $856.78 $1,774.22 NO BID NO BID
$13,366.72 $17,176.80 | $12,339.14 | $13,697.88 | $2,076.00 $1,234.42
Total NO BIDs 184 50 215 138 568 570




