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RFP# 20-003 TRAFFIC SIGNAL HARDWAI
M

ITS PLUS TEXAS WIRE AND JOBOTREX, INC PARADIGN GENERAL TRAFFIC ITERIS CTC Dynamic Vision
Extended Unit  Extended
DESCRIPTION UnitPrice  Extended Price  [Unit Price unit rice unit rice unit rice unitrice i rice  Price
Lor# no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
CONTROLLER UNITS 5200000 S 10,000.00
LoT#2
no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
CABINETS 9240005 4620000| 9955008 4977500 $10.500.00 § 52,500.00
LoT#2A
no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
BROADBAND RADIO AND ANTENNA
LoT#z8
no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
ADDITIONAL CONFLICT MONITORS $77400s 387000  $923.00 § 4615.00
Lotis
3 SECTION 12" POLYCARBONATE TRAFFIC SIGNAL WIBACK
PLATE AND PELCO AB-0125-3-84 MOUNTING BRACKETS S$30800S 1194000 $482005  1446000|  $410.00 $12.300.0( § 35500 S 1065000
5 SECTION 12" POLYCARBONATE TRAFFIC SIGNAL WIBACK
PLATE AND PELCO AB-0125-5-84 MOUNTING BRACKETS $56400 S 451200  §71900 575200 $585.00 $4.680.0 $ 50100 S 472800
PEDESTRIAN SIGNALS W/Z-CRATE VISOR AND CLAMSHELL|
WITH UNIVERSAL MOUNTING HARDWWARE AND LED'S $302008 966400 30100 963200  s235.00 $7.520.0( $ 25100 8 803200
PEDESTRIAN PUSH BUTTON ASSEMBLY PELCO SE-2011/SE no bid no bid no bid no bid
$132008 528000  $64.00 § 25560.00|  $100.00 $4.000.0 S 6400 S 256000
4 SECTION 12 POLYCARBONATE TRAFFIC SIGNAL W/BACK
PLATE AND PELCO AB-0125-5-84 MOUNTING BRACKETS $51000 S 8160.00[ 58200 § 931200 $480.00 $7.680.0 S 5200 8 899200
PIEZIO-UKIVEN SOLID S1ATEs SWITGH PELGO PAR 75t
2121 OR EQUAL BLACK IN COLOR TO INCLUDE MOUNTING
ADAPTER FOR PED. BUTTON ASSEMBLY PELCO PART# SE-
2023 5122005 488000 56400 5 2560.00] _ $108.00 54,3200 S 12700 S 508000
[TOTAL FORTOTHS 5 44,4360 427601 $40.500.00 5 400420
4-CH. 24 VDC POWER SUPPLY 275008 275000, $173.00 8 1,730.00 521000 'S 210000
4 CAMERA VIDEO DETECTION SYSTEM 7.965.00 §  39,825.00 no bid $11478' § 57,390.00 no bid $9.200.0C  $ 46,000.00
Detection Camere 94500 5 378000, $1071.00 § 4284.00 $750.00 |5 3,00000
Dual Camera Input processing card 174500 S 6.980.00 52078.00 § 8312.00 $1900.0C § 7.600.00
Video detection cable 050 S 50000 0928 92000 5150 5 1,500.00 $110 S 110000
Video monitor 20000 8 80000 no bid $169.00 § 676.00 $12500 S 50000
[FOTALFOR [oT# 5156350 T 00 —— 0 [~ s wos00mm]
OPTICOM DISCRIMINATOR MODULE MODEL 764 Multimode
OR EQUAL $ 260500 § 3366000
Model 3100 GPS Radio Unit (Mast Mount $ 277600 § 1388000
Ml 1070 GPS Cable s 105 8 525,00
OPTICOM OPTICAL DETECTOR MODEL P722 OR EQUA! o bid obid o bid obid o bid obid s 71800 8 1723200 o bid
MultiMode GPS Vehicle Kt (This takes the place of tems 5,6 &7) $ 35000 S 7.00000
Model 2100 High Priorty GPS Control Uni $ 372000 § 746000 Thess ftems are conl
Model 1050 GPS/Radio Antenn: $ 20000 S 10,000.00 These tems are con]
M. 2171 Vehicle Interface Cable
Ml 2171 Vehice Interace Cable (This tem must bo piced per each) s 19500 § 390.00 These tems are con]
[TOTAL FORLOT#5 5 B050700]
LoT #
3 CONDUCTOR CABLE 0298
7 CONDUCTOR GABLE ’ 057 ’ . . .
] CONDUCTOR ChBLE no bid uels no bid no bid no bid no bid NoBid no bid
OPTCOM CABLE 0228 4400 S 065 5 13.00000
[foTALFoRTOTRE | S Y0 §73.00000]
I I
LOT7- OMMITTED
Lot#e
PULL BOXES, SIZE 13X 24 X 1t i - i $188.00 § 3,760.00 i - - i
PULL BOXES, SIZE 17 X 30 X 18 o bi no bi o bi $571.00 § o bi no bi no bi no bi
[roTAL For LoT #8 S 1518000
LoT#e
SP-3027-TX-D ORNAMENTAL POLE CROWN ALUM. WITH AP
0105, 7 1/4" POLE CAF $46400S 556800  $43200 § 5184.00 $ 400 S 525600
SP-3027-TX-D ORNAMENTAL; POLE CROWN, ALUM WITH AP
0108, 10 172" POLE CAP $45200 S 1084800 $43200S  10368.00 $ 4800 S 1051200
PB-5354-D ALUMINUM ORNAMENTAL POLE BASE, 4-PC. FOR|
8- 12" DIA. POLE (D=9 112" $135200 S 1622400 582600 § 9912.00 $ 181900 § 2182800
PB-5355-D ALUMINUM ORNAMENTAL POLE BASE, 4-po. FOR no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
12'- 16" DIA. POLE (D=12 1/2') 2152005 0468800|  S20198  88:836.00) $ 20400 S 89.936.00
PB-5362 ORNAMEN TAL POLE CROWN, ALUM WITH
18.50'DIA. POLE CAP $71000S  7.10000] $1.025008 1025000 S 64500 S 845000
PB-5381 ORNAMENTAL POLE BASE, 4-pe. 21.18" dis 5208000 S 47.68000| 2861008 45776.00) $ 30200 § 4851200
PB-5412 ORNAMENTAL POLE BASE ADAPTER FOR LARGE
BASE FOR THE LMA'S $100500 5 16,08000| $437.00 § 6992.00 s 1752000
[oTALFoRTOTR | 500 T2 I
LoT #10
SOLAR POWEREDSCHOOL ZONE FLASHER ASSEMBLIES no bids
Lot #11
Red LED Traffc Signal Lamp $2400  312000|  $3800 S 494000|  524.95 5324350 s 2600 S 338000 275 351000
Yellow LED Traffc Signal Lam. $2400  192000| 84100 S 328000|  524.95 $1.996.0 S 2600 S 208000 205 232000
Green LED Traffc Signal Lamg $2400  312000|  $3000 S 507000|  524.95 5324350 s 2600 S 338000 275 351000
Left Green Arrow LED Traffic Signal Lamg no bids. no bids $3400S  204000|  $5200 § 312000|  $27.50 $1,650.0(} no bids s 2000 § 1,740.00 385§ 231000
Left Yellow Arrow LED Traffc Signal Lamg $3400  204000|  $44.00 264000|  $27.50 $1.650.0 s 200 5 174000 3155 1890.00
Yellow 12 VDC LED Traffic Signal Lamg $8200S  410000|  $41.00 S 205000| 585,00 $4.250.0( s 4300 § 215000 4655 232500
Gountdown Pedestrian Signal head LEC 9400 188000| $147.00 § 294000| 592,00 $1.840.0 s 900 S 196000 105 5 210000
Red Left Arow Traffc Signallamp LED $3400S  68000|  $4200 5 84000 s27.50 $550.0( s 2000 8 580,00 3155 63000
[Fotalfor ot #11 S 1890000 s 2488000 s 18.423.00] s 1701000 $ 1859500




